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Gist of the proceedings of the NCLT convened meeting of the Shareholders of the Company 
held on June 3, 2019. 

1. Date, time and venue of the AGM: 

The NCLT Convened Meeting of the Company was held on June 3, 2019 and the meeting 
commenced at 11.10 a.m. at "Yashwantrao Chavan Pratishthan Auditorium", Y. B. Chavan 
Centre, Near Mantralaya, Gen. J. Bhonsale Marg, Mumbai - 400 021 and concluded at 12.00 
noon (the "Meeting"). 

2. Brief details of the proceedings at the NCLT convened meeting: 

Mr. Duraiswami Narain, Chairperson appointed by the Hon'ble Tribunal chaired the 
proceedings of the Meeting and requisite quorum being present called the Meeting to order. 

Mr. Rajiv \Vani, Head - Law, Patents & Compliance & Company Secretary informed that the 
shareholders who have not cast their vote through postal ballot and e-voting are provided 
with electronic tab based voting at the Meeting venue. Mr. N. L. Bhatia, Practicing Company 
Secretary, appointed by the Hon'ble Tribunal vide its order dated April 22, 2019 as the 
Scrutinizer was also present at the Meeting to ensure that the voting process is conducted in a 
fair and transparent manner. 

The Chairperson then moved the resolution for approval of the Scheme of Amalgamation of 
Monsanto India Limited (the Transferor Company) with Bayer CropScience Limited (the 
Transferee Company) and their respective shareholders under Sections 230 to 232 and other 
applicable provisions of the Companies Act, 2013. The said Resolution was duly proposed 
and seconded by the members of the Company. 

The members were invited to make conuuents, offer suggestions or seek clarifications. The 
Chairperson responded to the queries raised by the members at the Meeting. 

He further informed the members that the combined result of postal ballot and c-voting as 
well as the voting done at the Tribunal Convened Meeting will be displayed on the website of 
the Company and the website of BSE Limited on or before June 5, 2019. 

The Chairperson thanked the members for attending and participating in the Meeting. 

3. Manner of approval of the Resolution: 

The Scrutinizer's Report was received on June 3, 2019 and the Resolution set out in the 
Notice of the NCLT convened meeting as mentioned below was passed with requisite 
majority. 

(i) Approval of the Scheme of Amalgamation of Monsanto India Limited (the Transferor 
Company) with Bayer CropScience Limited (the Transferee Company) and their 
respective shareholders under Sections 230 to 232 and other applicable provisions of the 
Companies Act, 2013. 


